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Academia is in trouble. Taxpayers are fed up with the enormous expenses associated with public universities,
as well as administrators whose strategies and goals are fuzzy at best and destructive at worst. Parents worry
about how they will find the wherewithal to send their offspring to college. Employers question the ability of
new graduates and degree holders to write or reason lucidly. And everyone (except entrenched faculty
members) questions the practice of tenure, which generally creates an incentive for mediocrity. Meanwhile,
academic authorities responsible for managing our august institutions of higher education pontificate about
the problems without delivering meaningful solutions. But meaningful solutions do exist, and this book
explains them in depth. Taking Back the Tower, a compendium of no-nonsense, management-oriented
lessons and prescriptions for the academy, will go a long way toward restoring the respect our colleges and
universities deserve.

Taking Back the Tower focuses squarely on bringing common sense to higher education by urging creative
thinking, especially out-of-the-box approaches, in promoting change. It offers numerous solutions, many of
which will be seen as quite controversial by the establishment. Smith outlines how to overcome resistance to
change, lead more effectively, demand accountability for performance, manage resources for the highest
return, remain firm with tuition payers and donors when warranted, manage costs to help keep the price of an
education contained, and much more. The secret is in managing the few key variables that will have the
biggest impact on overall results. The ideas are wholly practical and much less philosophical than those in
most books on the subject. Following them will help schools improve results across the board. Smith's
decades of experience as both a teacher and administrator in academia, as well as a consultant for many
public and private-sector organizations, make him the perfect author for this book. Moreover, his insights,
coupled with the many enlightening and entertaining examples (all true) will capture the attention of readers
and help them understand why change must come?and why it must be radical.
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From reader reviews:

Margie Sutton:

This Taking Back the Tower: Simple Solutions for Saving Higher Education book is not ordinary book, you
have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book will be information
inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of
information you will get. This Taking Back the Tower: Simple Solutions for Saving Higher Education
without we realize teach the one who studying it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't end up
being worry Taking Back the Tower: Simple Solutions for Saving Higher Education can bring any time you
are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it inside your lovely
laptop even telephone. This Taking Back the Tower: Simple Solutions for Saving Higher Education having
good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Kyle Gill:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book that
improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of publication you
read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want sense happy read one
along with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the Taking Back the Tower: Simple Solutions
for Saving Higher Education is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

John Edwards:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get lot of
stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely yes.
People is human not really a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity have you got when the
spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, typically the book you have
read is actually Taking Back the Tower: Simple Solutions for Saving Higher Education.

Sophie Clark:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Taking Back the Tower: Simple
Solutions for Saving Higher Education reserve written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to
make book that could be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written inside good manner for you,
leaking every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt Taking
Back the Tower: Simple Solutions for Saving Higher Education as good book not simply by the cover but
also from the content. This is one reserve that can break don't judge book by its handle, so do you still
needing one more sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why you
have to listening to another sixth sense.
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