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“Unbroken meets Band of Brothers?and then some.”
 ?Congressman Pete Sessions

During the Vietnam War, hundreds of American prisoners-of-war faced years of brutal conditions and
horrific torture at the hands of North Vietnamese guards and interrogators who ruthlessly plied them for
military intelligence and propaganda. Determined to maintain their Code of Conduct, the POWs developed a
powerful underground resistance. To quash it, their captors singled out its eleven leaders, Vietnam’s own
“dirty dozen,” and banished them to an isolated jail that would become known as Alcatraz. None would
leave its solitary cells and interrogation rooms unscathed; one would never return.

“Inspirational.” ?Kirkus Reviews
As these men suffered in Hanoi, their wives back at home launched an extraordinary campaign that would
ultimately spark the POW/MIA movement. When the survivors of Alcatraz finally returned, one would go on
to receive the Medal of Honor, another would become a U.S. Senator, and a third still serves in the U.S.
Congress. A story of survival and triumph, courage and brotherhood, Alvin Townley's Defiant is a
compelling work that no reader will soon forget.

“A riveting tribute to true American heroes.”?Senator John McCain, POW (1967-73)
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From reader reviews:

Cassandra Martin:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching
TV, or playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can
spent all day every day to reading a guide. The book Defiant: The POWs Who Endured Vietnam's Most
Infamous Prison it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book.
These people were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space bringing this
book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book through your smart
phone. The price is not too costly but this book offers high quality.

Phyllis Kelly:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Defiant: The POWs Who
Endured Vietnam's Most Infamous Prison, you could enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still need
to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand
it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Ollie Brooks:

The book untitled Defiant: The POWs Who Endured Vietnam's Most Infamous Prison contain a lot of
information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy method. The language is very clear to
see all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read that. The book was compiled by famous
author. The author brings you in the new time of literary works. You can read this book because you can
continue reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a
nice study.

Melvin Dove:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This kind of Defiant: The POWs Who Endured Vietnam's Most
Infamous Prison can give you a lot of pals because by you looking at this one book you have matter that they
don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more
than various other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let us have Defiant: The POWs Who



Endured Vietnam's Most Infamous Prison.
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