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This book makes a rare contribution towards the preservation and promotion of ukhaliro wa bene Malawi
(Malawian culture) that is fast waning. This dilution of culture was put in motion by the British colonial
masters and got exacerbated with the inception of democratic governance in 1994. There is need for
concerted efforts amongst various practitioners and stakeholders, led by the government itself, if the situation
is to be put under control. Otherwise, sooner or later, it will simply be remote history that 'long time ago,
there was a unique culture in Malawi'. The book is a collection of twenty short stories that generally promote
such themes as nkharo yiwemi (good behaviour); uheni wa chigolo na sanje (the bad side of selfishness and
jealousy); kulimbikira pa vinthu (hard working spirit); and uheni wa mitala (the folly of polygamy), among
others. The strength of the book lies in the fact that there is room for the reader to draw their own lessons
based on their understanding of a particular story, in addition to the lesson already highlighted there-in. The
book is a must read for all, young and old, especially those interested in understanding the societal values,
not only about Malawi, but of Africa as a whole.
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From reader reviews:

Andre Roop:

This Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is usually information inside this e-book incredible
fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This particular
Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi without we know teach the one who looking at it become critical
in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi can bring
whenever you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it
with your lovely laptop even telephone. This Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi having fine
arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Irene Gonzales:

This Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi is great publication for you because the content which is full
of information for you who else always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This book
reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we can say no rambling sentences inside. So if
you are read this hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with
straight forward sentences but hard core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Vidokoni:
Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous
1. We can say that no reserve that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen small right but this e-book
already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that
will?

Brandon Macdonald:

Beside this particular Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi in your phone, it could give you a way to
get more close to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you are going to got
here is fresh through the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow town.
It is good thing to have Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi because this book offers to you readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you do not get what it's about. Oh come on, that wil happen if
you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island.
Techniques you still want to miss it? Find this book in addition to read it from currently!

Elizabeth Nicholson:

Book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen will need book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those textbooks
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. By the
book Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi we can get more advantage. Don't you to be creative
people? Being creative person must choose to read a book. Only choose the best book that acceptable with



your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this book Vidokoni: Folktales from Mzimba, Malawi. You
can more desirable than now.
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