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The complex relationship between nationalism and masculinity has been explored both historically and
sociologically with one consistent conclusion: male concepts of courage and virility are at the core of
nationalism. In this ground-breaking book, the author questions this assumption and advances the debate
through an empirical analysis of masculinity in the revealing contexts of same-sex (football and polo) and
cross-sex (tango) relations. Because of its rich history, Argentina provides the ideal setting in which to study
the intersection of masculine and national constructs: hybridization, creolization and a culture of
performance have all informed both gender and national identities. Further, the author argues that, counter to
claims made by globalization theorists, the importance of performance to Argentinian men and women has a
long history and has powerfully shaped the national psyche.

But this book takes the analysis far beyond national boundaries to address general arguments in anthropology
which are not culture-specific, and the discussion poses important comparative questions and addresses
central theoretical issues, from the interplay of morality and ritual, to a comparison between the popular and
the aristocratic, to the importance of 'othering' in national constructions - particularly those relating to sport.

This book represents a major contribution, not only to anthropology, but to the study of gender, nationalism
and culture in its broadest sense.
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From reader reviews:

Laura Crabtree:

The feeling that you get from Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues
Series) will be the more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the words the more you get
considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but Masculinities: Football, Polo
and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series) giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The article
writer conveys their point in particular way that can be understood through anyone who read the item
because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your vocabulary
increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We highly recommend you for having this kind of Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in
Argentina (Global Issues Series) instantly.

Steven Murray:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
when those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously which
one is appropriate to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then
you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen in you if you take Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series) as
your daily resource information.

Raul Miller:

This book untitled Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series) to be one
of several books that will best seller in this year, here is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot
of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book store or you can order it via online.
The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this
book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this guide from your list.

Jacki Warner:

You will get this Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series) by visit the
bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve problem if you get
difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but
additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking
by your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more
information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are
still up-date. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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