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"Committed to Love" is a deeply personal one. It details the many issues and experiences I had to confront
and deal with in my twenty-five-year marriage to a bisexual man who succumbed to AIDS. The twenty-four
chapters in this book range from his diagnosis on June 19, 1992, with AIDS related pneumonia to his death
on August 17, 1994. Every aspect of my relationship with Dr. Jeffrey A. Mintz, both as my best friend of
thirty-seven years and my husband of twenty-five is explored in explicit detail. The challenge of a marriage
under these circumstances was to say the least, both chaotic yet most rewarding. My thoughts about love
evoked images of champagne, roses, and chocolates. Yes, I had a lot of all of them in my marriage, but the
reality and truth about my life with him was that the word love for me had always meant commitment,
unconditional acceptance, and facing every problem with a solution even if I didn't know what the solution
would be.

It is in this particular area that I feel my most powerful impact. To say that my marriage was unconventional
and that it was difficult is an understatement. But, I would do it all over again because my journey with Jeff
provided me the opportunity to discover my own true definition of love. For in those twenty-five years, I was
able to find my core, my strength, my faith, my hope, and my true understanding that I was chosen to love
him. I was chosen to stay with him. And I was chosen to be able to watch him become the stranger in my bed
due to the horrific devastation that his virus brought. To this day, I remain in my heart, Jeff's wife, friend,
caregiver, and devoted partner. My hope is that with this book, others may gather up the strength and
fortitude to commit to their marriage vows before God first and then, commit to their marriage. May this
book give you the understanding of how remarkably strong you can be and how capable you truly are when
"Committed to Love."
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From reader reviews:

Colby McCray:

This Committed to Love: A Woman's Journey Through Love and Loss is completely new way for you who
has intense curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you
upon it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having little bit of digest in reading this
Committed to Love: A Woman's Journey Through Love and Loss can be the light food to suit your needs
because the information inside that book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books build itself in the
form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in reserve
form make them feel tired even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is no in reading a publication
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss that!
Just read this e-book kind for your better life and also knowledge.

Randy Anderson:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What
you need to do is just spending your time little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of
the books in the top collection in your reading list is actually Committed to Love: A Woman's Journey
Through Love and Loss. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out
to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this book you can get many advantages.

Nick McAllister:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This guide Committed to Love: A Woman's Journey Through Love and Loss was filled
concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some
people has different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book,
you can experience enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you
wanted.

Elbert Lupton:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is published or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news. With
this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in
search of the Committed to Love: A Woman's Journey Through Love and Loss when you necessary it?
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